
Mr. W. L. Distant on Oriental Capsidu.
hue; head, pronotum, and scutellum very finely obscurely
punctate; head beneath, rostrutn, sternum, and legs ochra-
ceous;. abdomen beneath (excepting base) piceous; other
characters as in generic diagnosis.

Length 5j mm.
Hab. Ceylon; Peradeniya-(Green).

BADEZORUS, gen. nov.
Head ro'bust, subtriangular, about as long as broad, cen-

trally moderately arched, obscurely transversely striate;
antennai with the first joint thickened, shorter than head,
second joint three times- ;s long as first, third and fourth
joints subequal in length and together little more than the
length of second; rostrum not quite reaching the intermediate
coxse; pronotum at base about twice as long as broad and
less than twice as broad as anterior margin, moderately
deflected anteriorly, the lateral margins oblique, the posterior
angles obtusely rounded; scutellum broad, subtriangular;
corium (including cuneus) as long as posterior tibie,- cuneus
broad, at base considerably broader than long; membrane
passing abdominal apex, its greatest length almost equalling
that of corium (excluding cuneus); legs of moderate length,
longly spinulose, the posterior femora distinctly thickened,
posterior tarsi with the first and second joints subequal in
length.

This genus seems to be clearly located in the division
Camptotylaria, Reut.

Badezorus tyrianus, sp. n.
Head dull greyish; antennai obscure ochraceous the first

joint (more or less) and the base of the second joint piceous;
pronotum and scutellum virescent, sparsely palely pilose;
corium dull greyish, the clavus virescent, the costal area
strongly palely pilose, cuneus dull greyish, darkly pilose, at
the internal angle with a small black punctate spot;memI
brane dull greyish, with pale fuscous mottlings; body
beneath and legs pale ochraceous, posterior femora apically
black, tibia spotted with black, and from these spots on the
posterior tibia3 the spinules arise in pairs, all the spinules
black, apices of tarsi black; other characters as in generic
diagnosis.

Length 3 mm.
Hab. Punjab; Lahore (Annandale).
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